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Parish     
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5th October ’25     

27th Sunday in 

Ordinary Time 

 

Envelopes & Offertory Collection                                                                       

Total €991 

Weekday Masses Mon-Fri 9am Christ the King 

Cooleragh 

    

Tuesday Morning 9am Mass. Remembering 

those who are enduring the burden of injury or 

illness.  

Thursday Morning 9am Mass. Remembering 

especially those who have gone before us.      

Email:standco100@gmail.com                                                                  

Phone during office hours 045 860281                                                    

 

Anniversaries for the weekend  

Christ the King Church, Cooleragh 

Vigil Saturday 6.30pm  

Jason Dowling and remembering Margaret 

Byrne Allenwood  

 

St Benignus Church Staplestown 11.15am     

Remembering the Carroll, Costello, Walsh 

and Callan Families                                         

Una Fulton Coill Dubh also deceased 

members of the Cully and Fulton families     

Peg Fitzsimons Ballagh                                                            

 

Recently Deceased:Please remember in 

your prayers the family of the late Anne 

MacEoín Collins, of Gilltown whose funeral 

took place during the week  

Irish Catholic The Irish Catholic went up 

in price from 2nd October to €3.50. We 

thank you for the support of this Catholic 

newspaper. 
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11th -12th October  2025 
Ministers of the Word          

Christ the King, 
Cooleragh                                                   
Vigil Mass 6.30pm  
Michael Ward                                   
Sunday 8.30am.   
Louis Dockery                               
St Benignus, 
Staplestown 
Sunday 11.15am                                         
Maggie Kennedy                               

Ministers of the Eucharist                          
Christ the King, 
Cooleragh                                      
Saturday 6.30pm                                
Mary Aspell                           
Sunday 8.30am      
Catherine Harney 
St Benignus, Staplestown  
Sunday 11.15am    
Liam Holton 
 
Diocesan -Parish Lotto The 
Jackpot for next week’s draw 
is €20,000. Thank you for your 
support. Tickets at €2 can be 
purchased in Daybreak 
Supermarket Coill Dubh,  
Ward’s Shop Cooleragh, 
Styles & Smilzes Staplestown, 
Parish office during office 
hours or after weekend 
masses in our churches.   
 

Feast Days for the week                     
Monday: St Bruna                             
Tuesday:Our Lady of the 
Rosary                            
Thursday:Ss. John henry 
Newman, Denis and 
Companions, John 
Leonardi                                      
Saturday: St John XXIII 
                                 
Staplestown PTA will be 
hosting a fundraising concert 
with the fantastic four-part 
Adult Choir & Millicent 

Singers, on Friday October 
10th in Cooleragh church @ 
8pm. Joining Millicent Singers 
on the night will be a very 
special guest. Tickets cost €20 
and  are available on 
Eventbrite.ie. 
 
"Breast Cancer Awareness 
Month” takes place October 
1st-31st. For further 
information, please log 
onto www.breastcancerirelan
d.com." 

Marriage Enrichment 
Weekend:  Marriage 
Enrichment Weekend: Date: 
November 7th-9th Venue 
"Focolare" Centre, Curryhills, 
Prosperous, Co. Kildare.                                                              
For info. and 
booking www.marriageencou
nter.ie 

Catholics across the globe will 

unite to pray the Rosary for 

peace in war-torn lands, 

especially during the month 

of October, which the Church 

dedicates to the Holy Rosary. 

Pope Leo XIV made the 

announcement at the 

Wednesday General 

Audience. 

He said the faithful in Rome 

will gather in St. Peter’s 

Square on October, 11, 2025 

at 6:00 PM. 

“I invite everyone, each day of 

the coming month, to pray 

the Rosary for peace—

personally, in the family, and 

in community,” he said. 

                    
Ballinafagh Cemetery: 
Prayers and Blessings of 
Graves at Ballynafagh 
Cemetery, Sunday the 12th of 
October at 2pm, All welcome.  

Timahoe National School: 
Enrolment applications for 
Junior Infants 2026/2027 for 
Timahoe National School are 
being accepted from 6th 
October.  Application forms 
are available on the school's 
web sited: www.timahoens.ie 

An Tobar Nua. We 
provide confidential 
counselling nationwide via 
telephone and Zoom. Our 
service is donation-based, 
because we do not want 
finances to prevent anyone 
from receiving support.                                                                                                                                                                                       
If anyone  is struggling with 
grief, anxiety, depression, or 
other life challenges, please 
know that we are here to 
help. Phone: 091 562 
175   Email: counselling@anto
barnua.com 

Prayer for Christian Unity  
Lord Jesus, who on the eve of 
your death, prayed that all 
your disciples might be one, 
make us feel intense sorrow 
over the infidelity of our 
disunity. Give us honesty to 
recognise and the courage to 
reject whatever indifferences 
toward one another or mutual 
distrust, or even enmity lie 
hidden within us.                                          
Enable us to meet one 
another in you; and let your 
prayers for the unity of 
Christians be ever in our 
hearts and on our lips,                             
unity such as you desire and 
by means that you will.                            
Make us find that way that 
leads to unity in you through 
being obedient to the spirit of 
love and trust. AMEN.                   
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